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RESOLUTION NO. 17-169:

Bid Award — Asphalt Material Quotes - Engineer

The Commissioners do hereby approve the recommendations of the County Engineer that all quotations be
accepted.

County Engineer Marysville Operations Facility
Environmenlal Engineer 16400 County Home Road
Building Department Marysville, Ohio 43040
233 W Sixth Stroct P 937. 645 3017
Maryaville, Ohio 43040 F 937.645. 0011

937. 645. 3018
’ Richwood Qutpost

F 937.645. 3163

www,¢0,unlon,oh.us’engineer 190 Beatty Avenue

Richwood, Qhio 43344

Public Service with integrity

MEMO

TO: Board of Commissioners

FROM: Jeff Stauch

DATE: May 2, 2017

SUBJECT; Asphall Material Quotes received April 18, 2017

The refarendced quotations are summarized on the attached tabulation. We recommend that all quotations
be accepted.

We expect to purchase materials from the suppliers as follows (subject to availabilily, performance and
compliance with our specificalions):

RS-2 Terry Asphall Materals, Inc. $1.54

HFRS-2P (SBS) Terry Asphalt Materials, Inc. $1.87

CRS-2P (SBR) Asphalt Materials, Inc. $1.715

CSS-1H Asphalt Matenals, Inc. $1.265

Fast Dry Fog Seal Asphalt Materials, Inc, $1.365

Items 301-441 Shelly Materiais Inc.

Qﬁ‘f

Jeff Stauch, PE/P§ Jack Derr, AIA Bill Narducci, PE

Cuounty Engi | Eny | Engi Chicf Building Official Assistant County Engineer
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2017 Union County Asphalt Materials Quotations Tabulation
- Vatalaba Wit Shatly Malenak, Inc Struwser Construcbur Ing . i
Apr Mwernly, [ne st Malanals, inc Tho Appks Smah Corp Uriquo Paving Matorials
SN Wy Rg St Sl ey 1771 Harmon Ave 3040 McKinloy Ave oua|Terey Aspted Valouds 3993 E 630 ¢
Orgon O 480 o PR TNRNANIZY Fedy OM asadg  COMMDUR. OH 43223 Columbus, OH 43204 | eenilonTOR 45015 Clovetand, OH 44105
Contac? Phong Nurmbor A10-601-0626 B14444.5000 415 424 4850 814417-2358 14.488.7950 512074 6197 216.447 4850
Conlact Name Cameron Prrter Bwn Lo Seor 2 pchienir Troy Segner Carl Schewerer W Piiio Folfier Lot Hnoteman
Bada Canter Osbrandur 4107 - 121517 121817 - 433018
TTEM J01 61 gy Base o bid 63 00 357 50 §57.50 £05 .00 312000 o bid nobid
ITEM 302 Bit Agg Base no bd 363 00 $57 50 35750 $65 00 312000 no b« no bid
ITEM 441 Typs 1 { Inl} na bid $76 00 $70 50 $7050 90500 312000 no old no bid
ITEAM 441 Type 2 no bid $69 YU $83.50 $63 B0 §6500 §120.00 no bid no bid
ITEM 441 Typa 1 (Surface) no b $70 00 $7050 $70 50 $65 00 $12000 no kid no bid
Asghalt Cold Mix no bld o bid no bid no bid 311000 511000 no big $105 D0/pick up, UPM
permanan rapar malenal
MC-30 32 950 no hid no bid no bid na bld no bid no bid no bid
RS-2 $1.565 no bi¢ no bid no bid o bid na d §1 54 na bid
$2.500 1o big no bid na bid no bid na bid no bid no bid
IIFRS-2P (SBS) no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 5187 no bid
RS-2F (58S5) no bid na bid no bid no bid na bid no bid no bid no bid
CRS-2P (SBS) no bid o bid no bid na bid no bid no bid £187 no bid
HFRS-2P (SBR-lalox) $1.716 ne bid 00 bid no bid no bid no bid $197 no bid
RS-2P [S{R-iatax) 41715 00 bigt na bid no bid no bid no bid no bid na bid
CRS-2P {SAR-latas) $1.715 roba no bid no bid no bid no bid $197 no bid
CSS-1H (50% diluled Fog Seal) $1.265 na bid no bid ne bid no bid na bid $129 no bid
FAST DRYING FOG SEAL %1 365 (QF 40) no bid na bid no bid no bid no b $1.49 no bid
Pramium for Supply Bond - no bid na bid no bid no bid no hig no bid no bid
Demurage Rate _ $ec00 no bid no bid no bid no bid v b $100 00 per hour no bid
Sourco of Supply Etary ot iy no bid o bid no bkd na bid e g i Coal 2 Cay el o8

Motion by Steve Stolte and seconded by Charles Hall that this resolution be adopted and was carried by
the following vote:
Steve Stolte, Yea
Gary Lee, Yea
Charles Hall, Yea

%k %k ¥k
*The Commissioners met with Thayne Gray, Civil Prosecutor this date in regards to his regular meeting.
Discussions were held on the following.

o Discussions regarding the Ohio Department of Ag. notice regarding the property at 13191
Industrial parkway. No response required.

* *k ok

RESOLUTION NO. 17-170:

Authorizing the Submittal of an Application for PY2017 Community Housing Improvement and
Preservation Program (CHIP) Grant and Adoption of Policy and Procedure Manual

Updates/Amendments, as Needed Throughout the Program and Accepting Gant and Obligations if
Funded.

The Commissioners do hereby authorize the following.

WHEREAS, Union County has many unmet needs of low-moderate income persons who cannot afford to
make the needed repairs; and require financial assistance for the provision of affordable housing; as well
as other assistance to low-moderate income persons, and

WHEREAS, Union County procured the services of CHIP consultants and have selected CDC of Ohio,
Inc. to prepare the CHIP grant and to administer/implement the grant if funded,

WHEREAS, the State of Ohio, through the Ohio Development Services Agency proposes to have Program

Year (PY 2017) funds available as part of the Community Housing Improvement and Preservation Program
(CHIP), and



