ENGINEER'S

OPENING DATE

SEE PAGE 5

THURSDAY, APRIL 20, 2017 @ 2:00 P.M.

CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE

WW-EQUIP-05-17 FURNISH AND DELIVER CENTRIFUGAL PUMPS AND REPAIR

PARTS TO VARIOUS CMCMUA FACILITIES DAVE HEINER MID ATLANTIC PUMP & SHERWOOD-LOGAN &
ASSOCIATES, INC. HISCO PUMP, INC. J.T. SEELEY CO., INC. | EQUIPMENT COMPANY ASSOCIATES, INC.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY [ uNiITPrRICE]  ExT.PRICE]  uUNITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE| UNITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE] UNITPRICE]  EXT.PRICE[ UNITPRICE]  EXT.PRICE

PART A: ALLIS CHALMERS

1 [NSw 150, 4x4x7.5, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 6,279.00 6,279.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID: ADVANGED ENGINEERED PUMP

2 |NSRW 150, 4x4x12, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 2 | 7,751.00| 15,502.00 | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID: ADVANCED ENGINEERED PUMP

3 [NSRw 150, 4xax12, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 4 | 7,751.00] 31,004.00 | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID: ADVANGED ENGINEERED PUMP

4 |NSw 250, 6x6x17, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | 13,124.00| 13,124.00 | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID: ADVANCED ENGINEERED PUMP

5  |NSW 250, 6x6X14, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | 10,298.00] 10,298.00 | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID: ADVANGED ENGINEERED PUMP

6 |NSW 300, 4x4x14, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | 10,256.00 10,256.00 | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID: ADVANCED ENGINEERED PUMP

7 |ALLOWANCE FOR ADDITIONAL PARTS "AS NEEDED" 1 75,000.00 75,000.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART A NO BID 161,463.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

PART B: CLOW/YEOMANS

1 6317 SERIES 6000, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID

2 |6315 SERIES 6000, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | | | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID

3 |10522, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | | | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID

4 |ALLOWANCE FOR ADDITIONAL PARTS "AS NEEDED" 1

TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART B NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE

WW-EQUIP-05-17 FURNISH AND DELIVER CENTRIFUGAL PUMPS AND REPAIR

PARTS TO VARIOUS CMCMUA FACILITIES DAVE HEINER MID ATLANTIC PUMP & SHERWOOD-LOGAN &
ASSOCIATES, INC. HISCO PUMP, INC. J.T. SEELEY CO., INC. | EQUIPMENT COMPANY ASSOCIATES, INC.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY [ uNiITPrICE]  ExT.PRICE]  uUNnITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE| UNITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE] UNITPRICE]  EXT.PRICE[ UNITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE
PART C: CORNELL
1 |6NHTA-VC18DB, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 19,615.00 19,615.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID CORNELL 6NHTAVC18D8
2 |6NHTA-VC18DB, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | | | X X X X] X X X X |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID CORNELL 6NHTAVC1808
3 |10NHTB-VC18DB, OR EQIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 2 [ [ [ XXX X| X X X X [
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID
UFACTURER & MO CORNELL 10NHB-VC18DB
4 |ALLOWANCE FOR ADDITIONAL PARTS "AS NEEDED" 1 30,000.00 30,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART C NO BID NO BID NO BID 49,615.00 NO BID
PART D: FAIRBANKS MORSE
1 |16" MODEL-2414, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 3 78,066.00 234,198.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID FAIRBANKS-NIJHUIS
16 X 18 C-2414
2 |14-B5711; T-60, OR QUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 2 | | 26,038.00] 52,076.00 | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID FAIRBANKS-NIJHUIS
14 X 14 B-5711, T-60
3 |6" MODEL CB5416- T-60, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 2 | | 20,227.00 40,454.00 | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID FAIRBANKS-NIJHUIS
10 X 6 C-5416, T60
4 [14x14 B5711C, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 3 | | 26,138.00) 78,414.00 | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID FAIRBANKS-NIJHUIS
14 X 14 B-5711C
5  |8x10 B5415, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 3 | | 26,015.00| 78,045.00 | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID FAIRBANKS-NIJHUIS
8 X 10 C-5415
6 |8x10 B5415, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | | 26,015.00] 26,015.00 | |
MANUFACTUERE & MODEL # BID FAIRBANKS-NIJHAUS
C-5415
7 |10x12 B5415, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 3 | | 29,114.00| 87,342.00 | |

MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID

FAIRBANKS-NIJHAUS
10 X 12 C-5415
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ENGINEER'S OPENING DATE
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CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE

WW-EQUIP-05-17 FURNISH AND DELIVER CENTRIFUGAL PUMPS A
PARTS TO VARIOUS CMCMUA FACILITIES

ND REPAIR

DAVE HEINER
ASSOCIATES, INC.

HISCO PUMP, INC.

J.T. SEELEY CO., INC.

MID ATLANTIC PUMP &
EQUIPMENT COMPANY

SHERWOOD-LOGAN &
ASSOCIATES, INC.

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY [ uNiITPrICE]  ExT.PRICE]  uUNnITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE| UNITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE] UNITPRICE]  EXT.PRICE[ UNITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE
8 |B5414-T40, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 2 13,136.00 26,272.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID FAIRBANKS-NIJHAUS
4 X 5 B-5414, T-40
9 |[MODEL 5413, OR EQIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 2 12,915.00 25,830.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID FAIRBANKS-NIJHUIS
6 X 8 B-5413
10 |ALLOWANCE FOR ADDITIONAL PARTS "AS NEEDED" 1 75,000.00 75,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART D NO BID NO BID 723,646.00 NO BID NO BID
PART E: MORRIS
1 [NCD-M29700-02/6x8x15, OR EQUIVALENT, AS NEEDED 3
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID
2 |NCD-M-29707/10x10x20, OR EQUIVALENT, AS NEEDED 1 | | | | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID
3 |NCD-M29703/6x8x15, OR EQUIVALENT, AS NEEDED 3 | | | | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID
4 |VIT-FF, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 3 | | | | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID
5  |NCD-M-95026A02/6x6x15, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | | | | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID
6 |NCD-M95026A01/101020, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | | | | |
MANUFACTUERE & MODEL # BID
7 |NCD-M29706/8x8x16, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | | | | |
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID
8 |ALLOWANCE FOR ADDITIONAL PARTS "AS NEEDED" 1
TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART E NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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ENGINEER'S OPENING DATE

SEE PAGE 5 THURSDAY, APRIL 20, 2017 @ 2:00 P.M.

CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE

WW-EQUIP-05-17 FURNISH AND DELIVER CENTRIFUGAL PUMPS AND REPAIR

PARTS TO VARIOUS CMCMUA FACILITIES DAVE HEINER MID ATLANTIC PUMP & | SHERWOOD-LOGAN &
ASSOCIATES, INC. HISCO PUMP, INC. J.T. SEELEY CO., INC. | EQUIPMENT COMPANY |  ASSOCIATES, INC.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY [ uNiITPrICE]  ExT.PRICE]  uUNnITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE| UNITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE] UNITPRICE]  EXT.PRICE[ UNITPRICE]  ExT.PRICE
PART F: HAYWARD GORDON
1 |XR3-10, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 18 22,100.00 397,800.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID XR3-10 BARE PUMP*
HAYWARD GORDON
2 |XR4-7, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 8 | | | 14,749.00] 117,992.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID XR4-7 BARE PUMP*
HAYWARD GORDON
3 |xcs5A, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 | | | 18,250.00) 18,250.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID XC55A BARE PUMP*
HAYWARD GORDON
4 |ALLOWANCE FOR ADDITIONAL PARTS "AS NEEDED" 1 30,000.00] 30,000.00
*DOES NOT INCLUDE MOTOR
TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART F NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 564,042.00
PART G: MOYNO
1 [8PC, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 2
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID
2 |ALLOWANCE FOR ADDITIONAL PARTS "AS NEEDED" 1
TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART G NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PART H: WEMCO
1 |c; TORQUE FLOW, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 13,400.00 13,400.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID WEMCO MODEL C
2 |E: TORQUE FLOW, OR EQUIVALENT, AS SPECIFIED 1 8,250.00 8,250.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL # BID WEMCO MODEL G
3 |ALLOWANCE FOR PARTS "AS NEEDED" 1 20,000.00 20,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART H 41,650.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE

WW-EQUIP-05-17 FURNISH AND DELIVER CENTRIFUGAL PUMPS AND REPAIR

PARTS TO VARIOUS CMCMUA FACILITIES

DAVE HEINER MID ATLANTIC PUMP & | SHERWOOD-LOGAN &
ASSOCIATES, INC. HISCO PUMP, INC. J.T. SEELEY CO., INC. | EQUIPMENT COMPANY ASSOCIATES, INC.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE| UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE|  UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE|  UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE

BIDDER'S CHECKLIST X X X X X

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE X X X X X

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT X X X X X

DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN X X X X X

BIDDER'S EXPERIENCE (REFERENCES) NO X X NO X

MANUFACTURER'S SPECIFICATION/CUT SHEETS NO NO X NO X

MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION NO NO X X NO

N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE NO X X X X

IRS FORM W-9 NO NO X X X

PROPOSAL FORM(S) X X X X X

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT X X X X X

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:
PART A: $200,000.00
PART B: $150,000.00
PART C: $ 65,000.00
PART D: $880,000.00
PART E: $560,000.00
PART F: $700,000.00
PART G: $ 60,000.00
PART H: $ 55,000.00
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