

County of Jefferson
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591
Buyers
Michele Glover
Karin Dorr



Director
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
micheleg@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us

Account Clerk/Typists
Avis Gilmore
Amanda McCracken

NOTICE OF AWARD

August 25, 2017

Mr. Lawrence Clark, President
Clark Air Systems
7174 State Fair Blvd.
Syracuse, NY 13209

BID # 2017B-17

NAME: V-BELTS

CONTRACT PERIOD: DATE OF AWARD THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2019

Dear Mr. Clark,

I am pleased to inform you that your bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the bid.

A. Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:


V Purchase Order / V To be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti
Purchasing Director
C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Camfil, Kaman Industrial, Nobel Ace, RE Michel

RMA BELT #	JEFFERSON COUNTY REQUIREMENTS DESCRIPTION	CAMEFIL USA		CLARK AIR CONDITIONING		KAMAN INDUSTRIAL TECHNOLOGIES		NOBLE ACE HARDWARE		RE MICHEL	
		Date of Award - 8/31/2018	9/1/2018 - 8/31/19	Date of Award - 8/31/2018	9/1/2018 - 8/31/19	Date of Award - 8/31/2018	9/1/2018 - 8/31/19	Date of Award - 8/31/2018	9/1/2018 - 8/31/19	Date of Award - 8/31/2018	9/1/2018 - 8/31/19
A22	24" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$4.92	\$4.92	\$1.53	\$1.61	\$4.28	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.70	\$4.70
A29	31" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$5.43	\$5.43	\$1.91	\$2.00	\$4.99	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.47	\$5.47
A30	32" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$5.48	\$5.48	\$1.96	\$2.06	\$3.93	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.57	\$5.57
A31	33" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$5.59	\$5.59	\$2.01	\$2.11	\$4.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.64	\$5.64
A32	34" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$5.68	\$5.68	\$2.07	\$2.17	\$4.09	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.78	\$5.78
A33	35" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$5.76	\$5.76	\$2.13	\$2.24	\$4.14	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.83	\$5.83
A34	36" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$5.90	\$5.90	\$2.19	\$2.30	\$4.23	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.96	\$5.96
A35	37" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$2.24	\$2.35	\$4.29	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.04	\$6.04
A36	38" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$6.06	\$6.06	\$2.29	\$2.41	\$4.37	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.16	\$6.16
A38	40" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$6.36	\$6.36	\$2.41	\$2.53	\$4.57	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.44	\$6.44
A42	44" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$6.84	\$6.84	\$2.63	\$2.76	\$4.91	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.94	\$6.94
A44	47" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$7.03	\$7.03	\$2.75	\$2.88	\$5.05	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.13	\$7.13
A45	47" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$7.10	\$7.10	\$2.80	\$2.94	\$5.12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.21	\$7.21
A46	48" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$7.19	\$7.19	\$2.91	\$3.05	\$5.14	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.25	\$7.25
A48	50" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$7.30	\$7.30	\$2.97	\$3.12	\$6.76	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.42	\$7.42
A50	52" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$7.47	\$7.47	\$3.08	\$3.23	\$6.89	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.57	\$7.57
A57	59" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$8.07	\$8.07	\$3.48	\$3.65	\$5.79	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.18	\$8.18
A58	60" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$8.19	\$8.19	\$3.53	\$3.71	\$5.88	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.30	\$8.30
A59	61" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$8.28	\$8.28	\$3.59	\$3.77	\$5.94	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.39	\$8.39
A61	63" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$8.44	\$8.44	\$3.71	\$3.89	\$6.09	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.59	\$8.59
AX26	28" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$6.31	\$6.31	\$3.16	\$3.32	\$4.89	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.60	\$5.60
AX36	38" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$7.42	\$7.42	\$3.85	\$4.05	\$5.74	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.61	\$6.61
AX40	42" - 1/2" Top Width - 5/16" Thick	\$8.02	\$8.02	\$4.13	\$4.34	\$8.06	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.20	\$7.20
B28	31" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$6.90	\$6.90	\$2.51	\$2.63	\$6.39	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.02	\$7.02
B29	31" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$6.93	\$6.93	\$2.51	\$2.63	\$6.39	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.02	\$7.02
B25	28" - 21/32" Top Width - 13/32" Thick	\$10.11	\$10.11	\$2.29	\$2.41	\$5.76	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.32	\$6.32
B35	38" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$7.94	\$7.94	\$3.03	\$3.18	\$7.34	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.07	\$8.07
B38	41" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$8.91	\$8.91	\$3.24	\$3.40	\$6.29	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.87	\$8.87
B41	44" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$9.32	\$9.32	\$3.47	\$3.64	\$6.72	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.47	\$9.47
B44	47" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$9.94	\$9.94	\$3.69	\$3.88	\$7.14	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.08	\$10.08
B52	55" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$11.26	\$11.26	\$4.28	\$4.49	\$8.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.42	\$11.42
B53	56" - 21/32" Top Width - 13/32" Thick	\$11.31	\$11.31	\$4.36	\$4.58	\$8.14	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.49	\$11.49
B60	63" - 21/32" Top Width - 13/32" Thick	\$11.91	\$11.91	\$4.88	\$5.12	\$11.01	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.10	\$12.10
B61	64" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$12.08	\$12.08	\$4.96	\$5.21	\$11.18	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.26	\$12.26
B62	65" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$12.26	\$12.26	\$5.03	\$5.28	\$11.8	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.41	\$12.41
B70	73" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$13.47	\$13.47	\$5.63	\$5.91	\$9.68	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.67	\$13.67
B71	74" - 21/32" Top Width - 13/32" Thick	\$13.64	\$13.64	\$5.71	\$5.99	\$9.81	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.82	\$13.82
B80	83" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$15.31	\$15.31	\$6.37	\$6.69	\$10.99	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.53	\$15.53
B83	86" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$15.99	\$15.99	\$6.60	\$6.93	\$14.79	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.25	\$16.25
B94	97" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$18.08	\$18.08	\$7.43	\$7.80	\$19.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.67	\$19.67
B108	111" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$35.18	\$35.18	\$8.47	\$8.89	\$13.01	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.83	\$23.83
B136	139" - 21/32" Top Width - 7/16" Thick	\$44.26	\$44.26	\$10.57	\$11.10	\$18.62	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.09	\$24.09
	TOTAL PAGE 1	\$432.29	\$432.29	\$158.01	\$165.89	\$307.27				\$396.36	\$396.36

JEFFERSON COMMUNITY COLLEGE REQUIREMENTS	CAMFIL USA		CLARK AIR CONDITIONING		KAMAN INDUSTRIAL TECHNOLOGIES		NOBLE ACE HARDWARE		RE MICHEL	
	Date of Award	9/1/2018 - 8/31/19	Date of Award	9/1/2018 - 8/31/19	Date of Award	9/1/2018 - 8/31/19	Date of Award	9/1/2018 - 8/31/19	Date of Award	9/1/2018 - 8/31/19
	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH
BELT #	DESCRIPTION				RMA BELT #					
3L180	Standard 3L	\$3.60	\$1.17	\$1.23	1180		\$2.54	\$2.54	NO BID	NO BID
3L330	Standard 3L	\$4.19	\$1.92	\$2.02	1330		\$2.87	\$2.87	NO BID	NO BID
4L190	Standard 4L	\$3.95	\$1.28	\$1.34	1990		\$2.61	\$2.61	NO BID	NO BID
4L200	Standard 4L	\$3.95	\$1.32	\$1.39	2200		\$2.25	\$2.25	NO BID	NO BID
4L210	Standard 4L	\$3.95	\$1.37	\$1.44	2210		\$2.61	\$2.61	NO BID	NO BID
4L180	Standard 4L	\$3.95	\$1.23	\$1.29	2180		\$2.61	\$2.61	NO BID	NO BID
4L240	Standard 4L	\$3.95	\$1.53	\$1.61	2240		\$2.61	\$2.61	NO BID	NO BID
4L260	Standard 4L	\$4.00	\$1.64	\$1.72	2260		\$2.67	\$2.67	NO BID	NO BID
4L270	Standard 4L	\$4.07	\$1.69	\$1.78	2270		\$2.69	\$2.69	NO BID	NO BID
4L280	Standard 4L	\$4.14	\$1.75	\$1.83	2280		\$2.71	\$2.71	NO BID	NO BID
4L370	Standard 4L	\$4.78	\$2.24	\$2.25	2370		\$3.19	\$3.19	NO BID	NO BID
4L390	Standard 4L	\$4.99	\$2.35	\$2.46	2390		\$3.33	\$3.33	NO BID	NO BID
4L400	Standard 4L	\$5.07	\$2.41	\$2.53	2400		\$3.38	\$3.38	NO BID	NO BID
4L420	Standard 4L	\$5.26	\$2.52	\$2.65	2420		\$3.50	\$3.50	NO BID	NO BID
4L470	Standard 4L	\$5.47	\$2.63	\$2.76	2470		\$3.55	\$3.55	NO BID	NO BID
4L480	Standard 4L	\$5.72	\$2.85	\$3.00	2480		\$3.78	\$3.78	NO BID	NO BID
4L500	Standard 4L	\$5.84	\$2.97	\$3.12	2500		\$3.80	\$3.80	NO BID	NO BID
4L530	Standard 4L	\$6.04	\$3.13	\$3.29	2530		\$3.98	\$3.98	NO BID	NO BID
4L590	Standard 4L	\$6.16	\$3.25	\$3.42	2550		\$4.01	\$4.01	NO BID	NO BID
4L570	Standard 4L	\$6.31	\$3.36	\$3.53	2570		\$4.11	\$4.11	NO BID	NO BID
4L610	Standard 4L	\$6.60	\$3.59	\$3.77	2610		\$4.32	\$4.32	NO BID	NO BID
4L640	Standard 4L	\$6.84	\$3.76	\$3.95	2640		\$4.47	\$4.47	NO BID	NO BID
4L650	Standard 4L	\$6.94	\$3.81	\$4.00	2650		\$4.51	\$4.51	NO BID	NO BID
5L450G	Standard 5L	\$7.62	\$3.55	\$3.72	3450		\$7.98	\$7.98	NO BID	NO BID
5L500	Standard 5L	\$8.38	\$3.91	\$4.10	3500		\$8.76	\$8.76	NO BID	NO BID
5L510	Standard 5L	\$8.52	\$3.99	\$4.19	3510		\$8.91	\$8.91	NO BID	NO BID
5L820	Standard 5L	\$12.07	\$6.29	\$6.61	3820		\$12.61	\$12.61	NO BID	NO BID
B44	Gates Special	\$9.94	\$3.69	\$3.88			\$8.09	\$8.09	NO BID	NO BID
B48	Gates Special	\$10.67	\$3.99	\$4.19			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
B50	Gates Special	\$10.98	\$4.13	\$4.34			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
B54	Gates Special	\$11.44	\$4.43	\$4.65			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
B60	Gates Special	\$11.91	\$4.88	\$5.12			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
B67	Gates Special	\$13.00	\$5.40	\$5.67			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5VX610	Gates Special	\$27.74	\$13.63	\$14.31			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4X51	Gates Special	N/A					N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
	TOTAL BID	\$253.72	\$114.46	\$120.20			\$104.73	\$104.73	\$166.31	\$166.31
JEFFERSON COMMUNITY COLLEGE RESERVES THE RIGHT TO DELETE V-BELTS AT THE SOLE DISCRETION OF THE COUNTY AND ADD ADDITIONAL V-BELTS UPON AGREEMENT OF BOTH PARTIES THROUGHOUT THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT.										
ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS.										
THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.										
THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.										
										
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT										
8/1/19 DATE										