County of Jetterson Email Addresses:
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
micheleg@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

315-785-3077 avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
Fax: 315-785-7591 amcracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
Buyers .
Michele Glover ' o Account Clerk/Typist
Karin Dory Director Avis Gilmore
Mark Sachetti, CPPB Amanda McCracken
NOTICE OF AWARD

May 1, 2017

Attn.: Mr. Jeffrey Bly, President

O.H. Striping Inc.

11016 Rover Road

Corning, NY 14830 )

BID # 2017a-31 NAME: Runway and Taxiway Painting

CONTRACT PERIOD: May 1, 2017 through April 30, 2020
AWARD - AS HI-LITED
Dear Mr. Bly:

I am pleased to inform you that your bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has
been accepted based on full compliance, terms and conditions included in the bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

¢ Insurance Certificate - Commercial General Liability, Business
Automobile Liability

* Other: Please note that Jefferson County must be listed on your Insurance certificates
as an additional insured as noted in the bid document under Insurance Requirements.

lf'you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County
Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,
/m MWMJ i
Mark Sachetti {

Purchasing Director
CC: Department Auditor, Bid File



County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601

tmali Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
micheleg@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

315-785-3077 avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
Fax: 315-785-7591 amcracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
Buyers
Michele Glover ) Account Clerk/Typist
Karin Dorr Director Avis Gilmore
Mark Sachetti, CPPB Amanda Mccracken
NOTICE OF AWARD

May 1, 2017

Attn.: Mr. Matthew Sena, President

Seneca Pavement Marking

3526 Watkins Road

Horseheads, NY 14845

BID #2017a-31 NAME: Runway and Taxiway Painting

CONTRACT PERIOD: May 1, 2017 through April 30, 2020

AWARD - AS HI-LITED

Dear Mr. Sena:

I am pleased to inform you that your bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has
been accepted based on full compliance, terms and conditions included in the bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

e Insurance Certificate - Commercial General Liability, Business
Automobile Liability

* Other: Please note that Jefferson County must be listed on your Insurance certificates

as an additional insured as noted in the bid document under Insurance Requirements.

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County

Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

] SR
[ AN s @
Mark Sachetti :

Purchasing Director
CC: Department Auditor, Bid File



County of Jefferson Email Addresses:
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
micheleg@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

315-785-3077 avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
Fax: 315-785-7591 amcracken(@co.jefferson.ny.us
Buyers
Michele Glover Director Account Clerk/Typist
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB Avis Gilmore
Amanda McCracken
NOTICE OF AWARD

May 1, 2017

Attn.: Mr. Theodore Misiewicz, CFO Attn.: Mr. James O’Brien, Member

Hi-Lite Airfield Services Bothar Construction

18249 Hi-Lite Drive 170 East Service Road

Adams Center, NY 13606 Binghamton, NY 13901

BID # 2017a-31 NAME: Runway and Taxiway Painting

CONTRACT PERIOD: May 1, 2017 through April 30, 2020
AWARD - AS HI-LITED
Dear Sirs:

I am pleased to inform you that your bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has
been accepted based on full compliance, terms and conditions included in the bid.

Submittal requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or
pending:

Purchase Order / To Be Issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County
Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,
ﬂ@k QJM@”@
Mark Sachetti

Purchasing Director
CC: Department Auditor, Bid File, OH Striping, Seneca Pavement Marking



2017A-31 RUNWAY AND TAXIWAY PAINTING
BID TABULATION

BOTHAR CONSTRUCTION LLC HI-LITE AIRFIELD SERVICES O.H. STRIPING INC SENECA PAVEMENT MARKINGS
Item Unit Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
_ |Airfield Rubber Removal
Airfield Rubber Removal sf NO BID $0.02 $0.85 NO BID
Airfield Friction Testing ea NO BID $6,500.00 ° +°$5,000.00 NO BID
Airfield Surface Preparation (Clean Existing Markings) ) -
Airfield Surface Preparation (0-5,000 sf) sf NO BID (40,300 $6.85 $0.45
Airfield Surface Preparation (5,001-20,000 sf) sf NO BiD $1180.20 $3.85 $0.38
Airfield Surface Preparation (>20,001) sf NO BID 50,10 $0.85 $0.35
Airfield Paint Removal
Airfield Paint Removal- Grinding (0-5,000 sf) sf NO BID $6.00 $2.00
Airfield Paint Removal- Grinding (5,001-20,000 sf) sf NO BID $1.50 $1.50
Airfield Paint Removal- Grinding {>20,001} sf NO 8ID 180,50 $1.50
Airfield Paint Removal- Waterblasting (0-5,000 sf) sf - NOBID $8.00 NO BID
Airfield Paint Removal- Waterblasting {5,001-20,000 sf) sf NO BID $1.75 NO BID
Airfield Paint Removal- Waterblasting (>20,001) sf NO BiD $1.00 NO BID
Airfield Paint Removal- Combination Method {0-5,000 sf) sf NOBID $8.00 NO BID
Airfield Paint Removal- Combination Method {5,001-20,000 sf) sf NO BID $1.75 NO BID
Airfield Paint Removal- Combination Method {>20,001) sf NO BID $1.00 NO BID
Airfield Painting: P-620 .
Airfield Painting- White (0-5,000 sf) sf NO BID $3.50 $3.50
Airfield Painting- White (5,001-20,000 sf) sf NOBID $2.90 $1.50
Airfield Painting- White {> 20,001 sf) sf NO BID $2.40 $1.25
Airfield Painting- Yellow (0-5,000 sf) sf NO BID $3.50 $3.50
Airfield Painting- Yellow (5,001-20,000 sf) sf NO BID $2.90 $1.50
Airfield Painting- Yellow (> 20,001 sf) sf NO BID $2.40 $1.25
Airfield Painting- Black {0-5,000 sf) sf NO BID . $3.50 $3.50
Airfield Painting- Black {5,001-20,000 sf) sf NOBID 50,/ ~ $2.90 $1.50
Airfield Painting- Black {> 20,001, sf) sf NO BID $0. $2.40 $1.26
Airfield Painting- Red (0-5,000 sf) sf NOBID $1.0(0 $8.00 $3.50
Airfield Painting- Red (5,001-20,000 sf) sf NO BID 60,5 $6.00 $1.50
Airfield Painting- Red (> 20,001 sf) sf NO BID $0.45 b0t $1.25
Airfield Painting- Green (0-5,000 sf) sf NO BID :52.00 $8.00 $3.50
Airfield Painting- Green (5,001-20,000 sf) sf NO BID $1.85 $6.00 8180
|airfield Painting- Green (> 20,001 sf) sf NO BID $1.70 Caaseo i $1.25
Airfield Painting- Temporary, Primer Coat, First Coat sf NO BID 151.00 NO BID $3.50
Airfield Reflective Media
Airfield Reflective Media- Type | sf NO BID 2$0.05 $1.50 $0.25
Airfield Reflective Media- Type Il sf NO BiD $0.30 $5.75 1802550
Airfield Surface Painted Signs
Airfield Surface Painted Signs- Waterborne sf NO BID $20.00 $5.00
Airfield Surface Painted Signs- Preformed Thermoplastic sf NO BID NO BID 281250
Airfield Crack Sealing Blow and Go: (1/4"-3/4")
Airfield Crack Sealing- {0-5,000 if) If $1.75 $2.00 NO BID
Airfield Crack Sealing- (5,001-20,000 If) If $1.50 $1.50 NO BID
" {Airfield Crack Sealing- {> 20,001) If $1.13 $1.00 NOBID
Ehancement: Routing If 250,50 $1.50 NO BID
Setup Cost
Rubber/Paint Removal/Airfield Painting: Setup Cost {Cost shall
include all mobilization Costs, cost of salaries, overhead, fringe sf NO BID $0.50 $0.25
benefits, operating margin, expenses and travel expenses)
Rubber/Paint Removal/Airfield Painting: Night Time Work, Required
due To Airport Schedule Only o e ‘ sf -NOBID $0.50 $025
Crack Sealing: Setup Cost (Cost shall include all mobilization Costs,
cost of salaries, overhead, fringe benefits, operating margin, If $0.20 $0.20 NOBID
expenses and travel expenses) )
grnal;k Sealing: Night Time Work, Required due To Airport Schedule If $0.50 $0.20 NOBID

Notes for Setup Calculation

Setup for Rubber/Paint Removal/Airfield Painting includes all of the square feet combined; not to include refelctive media, or paint enhancements.

Setup for Airfield Crack Sealing includes total linear feet only

ALL DATA 1S PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF 8ID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED
AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED 8Y THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT. THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.
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