N

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street :
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
micheleg@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Michele Glover ) Account Clerk/Typists
Karin Dorr Director . Avis Gilmore
Mark Sachetti, CPPB Amanda McCracken
NOTICE OF AWARD

JUNE 29, 2017

ATTN KEVIN MCCOY

UNITED RADIO INC

57013 ENTREPRISE PARKWAY

E SYRACUSE NY 13057

BID #17-14 NAME: COMMUNICATIONS E_QUIPMENT ~ RADIO PURCHASES

AWARD: AS PER HIGHLIGHTED ITEMS
CONTRACT PERIOD:  9/1/17 - 8/31/18
Dear Mr. McCoy:

I am pleased to inform you that your bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on
full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the bid.

- Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:
Purchase Order vV To be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincg

MafieSachetti
Purchasing Director
C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Wells Communication Service Inc
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County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers

Michele Glover

Karin Dorr

Director

Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses;

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
micheleg@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us

Account Clerk/Typists
Avis Gilmore
Amanda McCracken

JUNE 29, 2017

ATTN MICHAEL RICCI

WELLS COMMUNICATION SERVICE INC
22746 COUNTY ROUTE 31
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #17-14 NAME: COMMUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT — RADIO PURCHASES

AWARD: AS PER HIGHLIGHTED ITEMS

CONTRACT PERIOD: g9/1/17 - 8/31/18

Dear Mr. Ricci:

NOTICE OF AWARD

I'am pleased to inform you that your bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on

full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending: ,

Purchase Order V To be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Purchasing Director
G Department, Auditor, Bid File, United Radio Inc
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BID #17-14
RADIO EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION
JEFFERSON COUNTY IS SOLICITING BIDS FOR THE FOLLOWING RADIO EQUIPMENT IO BE PURCHASED ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS FOR THE PERIOD g/1/17 - 8/31/18.
ALL BID PRICING MUST REMAIN FIRM THROUGHOUT THE CONTRACT TERM AND BE FOB DELIVERED TO JEFFERSON COUNTY DEFARTMENTS.
NYSC - #PT67405
WELLS WELLS v
COMMUNICATION |UNITED RADIO INC| COMMUNICATION | LAST BID PRICING
SERVICE INC SERVICE INC OR
UNITED RADIO INC
i UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
VERTEX STANDARD VX-264 PORTABLES
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, DISPLAY,
LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-264-Do-5, FNB-V433LI-UNI,
VX-264-Do-5 STANDARD UNI PKG CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 134-174 MHZ, NOBID NiA $208.70
16 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS ;
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, DISPLAY,
. LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-264-Do-5, FNB-V134LI-UNI,
VX-264-Do-5 UNI HIGH CAP PKG CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 134-174 MHZ, NOBID N/A $223.10
16 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, DISPLAY,
LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-264-G7-5, FNB-V133LI-UNI,
VX-264-G7-5 STANDARD UNI PKG CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ, NOBID N/A $208.70
16 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWC WAY, PORTABLE, DISPLAY,
LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-264-G7-5, FNB-V134LI-UNI,
VX-264-G7-5 UNIHIGH CAP PKG CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ, NOBID N/A 522310
16 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
VERTEX STANDARD VX-264 ACCESSORIES
ANTENNAS _ _ g
ATV 3B ANTENNA 150-163 MHz ] SABLE / 6" NO BID N/A $10.00
ATU-6D 450-485 MHZ / RED / 6" / VX-10/160/180/210/400/600/800/900 NO BID N/A $10.00
ATU-6DS 450-485MHZ 3.5"160/180/210/4/6/8 NO BID N/A $10.00
BATTERIES
FNB-V133LI-UNI BATTERY - 7.4V, 1380 mAh Li-lon BATTERY PACK, UNI NO BID NJA $28.70
FNB-V134LI-UN! BATTERY - 7.4V, 2300 mAh Li-lon BATTERY PACK, UNI NO BID N/A $50.30
CHARGERS
VAC-UNIB DESK TOP RAPID UNIVERSAL CHARGER FOR UNI BATTERIES, 120VAC, US NO BID N/A $25.90
VAC-6058 (US) 6-UNIT RAPID MULTI CHARGER FOR UNI BATTERTIES 120VAC, US NO BID N/A $324.99
VM5 VEHICULAR CHARGER MOUNTING ADAPTER KIT FOR VAC.UN! NO BID N/A $51.00
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BID #17-14
RADIO EQUIPMENT
BID TABULATION

NYSC - #PT67405
WELLS WELLS
COMMUNICATION |UNITED RADIO INC| COMMUNICATION LAST BID PRICING
SERVICE INC SERVICE INC OR
UNITED RADIO INC
UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
PROGRAMMING CABLES
CT-106 FIF-12 TO VX-160/180/410/420 CABLE NO BID N/A $28.79
USB INTERFACE FOR PC PROGRAMMING CHECK SPECIFIC MODELS FOR ADDITIONAL PIGTAIL
& N/A 107.00
FIF-12A CABLES. PIGTAILS NOT INCLUDED NOBID / $107,
SPEAKER MICROPHONES _
ICROP HEAVY D PUBLIC SAFETY STYLE W/VOLUME SWITCH, INTRINSICALLY
MH-45B48 SPEAKER MICROPHONE, uTY C SAFETY VO CH, NO BID N/A $59.00
SAFE
COMPACT SPEAKER MICROPHONE FOR VX-210A, VX-160, AND VX-180. VERY SIMILAR TO THE MH-
MH-360S crse R OR 108, ’ S NOBID N/A $15.00
34D4B.
MH-450S SPEAKER
- N .
MICROPHONE MH-450S SPEAKER MICROPHONE NOBID N/A $19.10
BELTCP | | | | | | |
CLIP-20 BELT CLIP NO BID N/A $7.10
VERTEX STANDARD VX-450 PORTABLES
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-Do STANDARD UNI PKG MODEL VX-454-Do, FNB-V133LI-UNI, CHOICE OF VAC-UN! CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTEN NA, 136-174 NO BID N/A $273.50
MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-Do HIGH CAP UNI PKG MODEL VX-454-Do, FNB-V134LI-UNI, CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 136-174 NO BID N/A $295.10
MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-Do FNB-V112LI PKG MODEL VX-454-Do, FNB-V112L, VAC- 450 CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 136-174 MHZ, 512 NO BID N/A $279.50
CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-Do FNB-V113LI PKG MODEL VX-454-Do, FNB-V113LI, VAC- 450 CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 136-174 MHZ, 512 NOBID N/A $301.10
CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-Do IS PKG MODEL VX-454-Do, FNB-V113LIIS, VAC- 450 CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 136-174 MHZ, 512 NO BID N/A $334.70
CHANNELS, 5 WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE

mI>me/w=uw/w>§,\|l
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BID #17-14
RADIO EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION
NYSC - #PT67405
WELLS WELLS
COMMUNICATION |UNITED RADIO INC| COMMUNICATION | LAST BID PRICING
SERVICE INC SERVICE INC OR
UNITED RADIO INC
UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-Do IS UNI PKG MODEL VX-454-Do, FNB-V134LIIS-UNI, VAC-CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, NO BID N/A $334.70
136-174 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE )
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-G6 STANDARD UNI PKG MODEL VX-454-G6, FNB-V133LI-UN, CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 NO BID N/A $273.50
MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS - ,
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-G6 HIGH CAP UNI PKG MODEL VX-454-G6, FNB-V134LI-UNI, CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 NO BID NJA $295.10
MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-G6 FNB-V112LI PKG MODEL VX-454-G6, FNB-V112LI, VAC- 450 CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 MHZ, 512 NO BID N/A $279.50
CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-G6 FNBV113LI PKG MODEL VX-454-G6, FNB-V113LI, VAC- 450 CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 MHZ, 512 NO BID NJA $301.10
CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-G6 IS PKG MODEL VX-454-G6, FNB-V113LIIS, VAC- 450 CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 MHZ, 512 NO BID N/A $334.70
CHANNELS, 5 WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-G6 IS UNI PKG MODEL VX-454-G6, FNBV134L1IS-UNI, CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400- NO BID N/A $334.70
470 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-G7 STANDARD UNI PKG MODEL VX-454-G7, FNB-V133LI-UNI, CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 NO BID N/A $273.50
MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD; TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-454-G7, FNB-V134LI-UNI,
VX-454-G7 HIGH NI PK .
454-G7 HIGH CAP UNI PKG CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ,” NOBID N/A $295.10
512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS

mI>EWU/w_Um/w>Uw/
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BID #17-14
RADIO EQUIPMENT
BID TABULATION

NYSC - #PT67405

WELLS WELLS
COMMUNICATION |UNITED RADIO INC| COMMUNICATION | LAST BID PRICING
SERVICE INC SERVICE INC OR
UNITED RADIO INC
UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-454-G7, FNB-V412L 1, VAC-
454 g D N 279.
VX-454-G7 FNB-V112L1 PKG 450 CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 NOB A $279:50
WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-454-G7, FNB-VA13L1, VAC-
VX-454-G7 FNB-V113LI PKG 450 CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 NOBID N/A $301.20
WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-454-G7, FNB-VH3LIIS, VAC-
-454-G7 1S PK g )
VX-454-G7 1S PKG 450 CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 NOBID N/A $334.70
WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE :
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, LIMITED KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-454-G7 1S UNI PKG MODEL VX-454-G7, FNB-V134LIiS-UNI, CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450- NO BID N/A $334.70
512 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-459-Do STANDARD UNI PKG MODEL VX-459-Do, FNB-V133LI-UNI, CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 136-174 NOBID N/A $316.80
MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-459-D0 HIGH CAP UNI PKG MODEL VX-459-Do, FNBV134L1-UNI, CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 136-174 NOBID N/A $338.30
MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY, FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES
VX-459-Do FNBVa12LI PKG MODEL VX-459-Do, FNB-V112L1, VAC-450 CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 136-174 MHZ, 512 NO BID N/A $322.70
CHANNELS, § WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-D0, FNB-V113LI, VAC-450
-459-D0 FNBV113LI P N NJA 30
VX459 VI13LIPKG CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 136-174 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 oBIb / $344:3
WATTS
Ve — -
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BID #17-14
RADIO EQUIPMENT
BID TABULATION

WELLS
COMMUNICATION
SERVICE INC

UNITED RADIO INC

NYSC - #PT67405
WELLS
COMMUNICATION
SERVICE INC OR
UNITED RADIO INC

LAST BID PRICING

UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED

UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED

UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED

UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED

VX-459-Do IS PKG

RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-Do, FNB-V113LIIS, VAC-450
CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 136-174 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5
WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE

VX-459-D0 1S UNI PKG

RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-Do, FNB-V134LIIS-UNI,
CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 136-174 MHZ,
512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE

VX-459-G6 STANDARD UNI PKG

RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEPYAD, MODEL VX-459-G6, FNB-V133LI-UN!, CHOICE OF VACUNI
CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5
WATTS

VX-459-G6 HIGH CAP UNI PKG

RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-455-G6, FNB-V134LI-UNI,
CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 MHZ,
512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS

VX-459-G6 FNB-V112LI PKG

RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-G6, FNB-V112LI, VAC-450
CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5
WATTS

NOBID

N/A

$375.00

NO BID

N/A

$375.00

NO BID

N/A

$316.70

NO BID

N/A

$338.30

VX-459-G6 FNB-V113LI PKG

RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-G6, FNB-V113L1, VAC-450
CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5
WATTS

NO BID

N/A

$322.70

VX-459-G6 IS PKG

RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-G6, FNB-V113LIIS, VAC-450
CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5
WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE

VX-459-G6 IS UNI PKG

RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-G6, FNB-V134LIIS-UNI,
CHOICE OF YAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 400-470 MHZ,
512 hI>ZZm_um_ 5 WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE

NO BID

N/A

$344.30

NO BID

N/A

$377.00

VX-459-G7 STANDARD UN{ PKG

RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-G7, FNB-V133LI-UNI,
CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ,
512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS

NO BID

N/A

$377.00

NO BID

N/A

$316.70

\l/
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BID #17-14
RADIO EQUIPMENT
BID TABULATION

NYSC - #PT67405
WELLS WELLS
COMMUNICATION |UNITED RADIO INC| COMMUNICATION | LAST BID PRICING
SERVICE INC SERVICE INC OR
UNITED RADIO INC
UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED "DELIVERED
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-G7, FNB-V134LI-UNI,
VX-459-G7 HI P UNI PK » © 338,
459-G7 HIGH CA ¢ CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ, NOBID N/A $338.00
512 CHANNELS, § WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
VX-459-G7 ENB-V112LI PKG FULL KEYPAD MODEL VX-459-G7, FNB-V112L], VAC-450 CHARGER, NO BID N/A $322.00
: CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-G7, FNBV413LL, VAC-450
VX-459-G7 FNB-VI13LI PKG g i
459-47 T3LIPK CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 NOBID NIA $344.00
WATTS
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-G7, FNB-V113LIIS, VAC-450
VX-459-G7 IS P ) :
459-G7 1S PKG CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450512 MHZ, 512 CHANNELS, 5 NOBID N/A $377.00
WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE
RADIO, VERTEX STANDARD, TWO WAY, PORTABLE, LCD DISPLAY,
FULL KEYPAD, INCLUDES MODEL VX-459-G7, FNB-V134LIIS-
VX-459-G7 IS UNI PK :
45947 G CHOICE OF VAC-UNI CHARGER, CHOICE OF ANTENNA, 450-512 MHZ, NOBID N/A $377.00
512 CHANNELS, 5 WATTS, INTRINSICALLY SAFE
VERTEX STANDARD VX-450 ACCESSORIES
anrennas | |
ATV-168B ANTENNA - VHF 150-162 MHz NO BID N/A $10.00
ATU-16D ANTENNA - UHF 450-470Mhz NO BiD N/A $10.00
BATTERIES
FNB-V12LI BATTERY - 7.4V, 1170 mAh Li-ion BATTERY PACK NO BID N/A $34.70
FNB-V433LI-UNI BATTERY - 7.4V, 1380 mAh Li-lon BATTERY PACK, UNI NO BID N/A $28.70
FNB-V113LI BATTERY -7.4V, 2400 mAh Li-ion BATTERY PACK NQ BID N/A $56.30
FNB-V134LI-UNI BATTERY - 7.4V, 2300 mAh Li-lon BATTERY PACK, UN! NO BID N/A $50.30
FNBV413LIIS BATTERY -7.4V, 2300 mAh Li-lon BATTERY PACK, INTRINSICALLY SAFE NO BID N/A $86.30
FNB-V134LIIS-UNI BATTERY -7.4V 2300 mAh Li-lon BATTERY PACK, UNI, INTRINSICALLY SAFE NO BID N/A $86.30
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BID #17-14
RADIO EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION
NYSC - #PT67405
WELLS WELLS
COMMUNICATION |UNITED RADIO INC| COMMUNICATION LAST BID PRICING
SERVICE INC SERVICE INC OR
UNITED RADIO INC
UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID _wx_nm UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED . DELIVERED
BELTCLIP
CLIP-20 BELT CLIP - VX-450 SERIES NO BID N/A $7.15
LEATHER CARRY CASES
LCC-454/459S LEALHER CASE, SWIVEL BELT LOOP (FNB-V112LI) NO BID N/A $23.00
LCC-454/459SH LEATHER CASE, SWIVEL BELT LOOP (FNB-V113LI) NO BID N/A $30.20
CHARGERS
VAC-6450 6-UNIT MULTI CHARGER NO BID N/A $320.00
VAC-6450C 6-UNIT MULTI CHARGER NO BID N/A $320.00
VAC-6058 ACmv 6-UNIT RAPID MULTI CHARGER FOR UNI BATTERIES, 120VAC, US NO BID N/A $320.00
VAC-450B (PA45B/CD49) [CHARGER - VAC- 4508 (INCL: PA45B & CD-49) NO BID N/A $25.75
VAC-450C CHARGER - VAC- 450B (INCL: PA45B & CD-49) NO BID N/A $25.75
VAC-UNI-B DESK TOP RAP!D UNIVERSAL CHARGER FOR UNI BATTERIES, 120VAC, US NO BID N . N/A $25.75
VCM-5 VEHICULAR CHARGER MOUNTING ADAPTER KIT FOR VAC-UNI{ NO BID N/A $51.75
OPTION BOARD
DVS-9 DVS-9 MANDOWN & VOICE STORAGE NO BID N/A $71.99
PROGRAMMING CABLES ‘
CT-106 PROGRAMMING - FIF-12 TO VX-160/180/410/420/450 CABLE NOBID N/A $28.70
FIF-12A USB INTERFACE FOR PC PROGRAMMING. CHECK SPECIFIC MODELS FOR ADDITIONAL PIGTAIL NO BID N/A $107.90
|SPEAKER MICROPHONES _ | _ _ | _
MH-360S SPEAKER MIC - COMPACT SPEAKER MICROPHONE FOR VX-210A, VX-160, VX-180 & NOBID N/A ) $15.10
SPEAKER MIC - MH-450S gmU_CZ_._uC.Q SPEAKER MICROPHONE W/LAPEL CLIP AND 3.5mm EAR NO BID N/A $19.10
MH-450S PHONE JACK
NO BID N/A $59.00
MH-45B48B SPEAKER MIC- NOISE CANCELLING SPEAKER MICROPHONE
NO BID N/A $66.20
MH-66A4B IP 57 SUBMERSIBLE MICROPHONE
KENWOOD TK-X312 SERIES PORTABLE RADIOS
136-174 MHz VHF 5W, 128 Ch. KNB-45L (2000mAh) BATTERY, KSC-355K (3 hr) CHARGER, KRA-26M .
K- . .
TK-2312K (VHF) ANTENNA, AND KBH-10 BELT CLIP INCLUDED §262.50 N/A $245.00
\\l/, o~ L,
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BID #17-14
RADIO EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION
NYSC - #PT67405
WELLS WELLS .
COMMUNICATION [UNITED RADIO INC{ COMMUNICATION LAST BID PRICING
SERVICE INC SERVICE INC OR
. UNITED RADIO INC
UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE
_ _ _ _ _ _ DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
400-470 MHz UHF 5W, 128 Ch. KNB-45L (2000mAh) BATTERY, KSC-355K (3 hr) CHARGER, KRA-27M ,
k331262 (UHF) ANTENNA, AND KBH-10 BELT CLIP INCLUDED $262.50 N/A $245.00
KENWOQOD x312 SERIES ACCESSORIES
KNB-45L 2000 mAh Li-ion 22 HOURS LIFE @ 5-5-90 DUTY N/A $44.10
|CHARGERS
KSC-355K 110 volt FAST RATE SINGLE UNIT CHARGER FOR KNB-45L/69L N/A $22.99
ANTENNAS
KRA-26 M VHF HELICAL ANTENNA 146-162 MHz N/A $10.22
KRA-27M UHF WHIP ANTENNA 440-490 MHz N/A $10.22
KRA-16M VHF STUBBY ANTENNA 148-162 MHz N/A $10.00
KRA-17M UHF STUBBY ANTENNA 450-490 MHz N/A $10.00
KRA-41M VHF STUBBY ANTENNA 148-162 MHz N/A $10.00
KRA-42M UHF STUBBY ANTENNA 440-490 MHz N/A $10.00
BEITCLIP
KBH-10 SPRING ACTION BELT CLIP FOR TK-200/80/90/5400 SERIES N/A $6.10
CARRBYING CASES
KLH-178 HEAVY DUTY LEATHER CARRYING CASE FOR TK-2312/3312| $33.19 N/A $30.97
SPEAKER MICROPHONE .
KMC-45 SPEAKER MICROPHONE AmC:.._.._Z 2.5mm MINIATURE m>m_uIOZmu>QC 1P54/55 STANDARD FOR $64.50 N/A $62.78
TOTAL $761.90 \
KENWOOD TK-X180 SERIES PORTABLE RADIOS
TK-2180 VHF LI-ION BATTERY PACKAGE = RADIO, KNB-33L BATTERY, KSC-32 CHARGER AND BELT CLIP ** $538.50 N/A $524.14
TK-2180K-LKP
TK-3180 UHF LIHON BATTERY PACKAGE = RADIO, KNB-33L BATTERY, KSC-32 CHARGER AND BELT CLIP ** $551.25 N/A $536.55
TK-3180K2-LKP
**MUST ORDER ANTENNA SEPARATELY $10.27
OPTIONS:
KCT-57MS MAN DOWN OPTION BOARD FOR MDC-1200 $16.50 N/A $15.25
{1610 FACTORY INSTALLATION FOR KCT-57MS MAN DOWN OPTION BOARD AZ_OO.ANOOV*** $16.50 N/A $19.99
**% \UST BE ORDERED WITH A RADIO PURCHASE _ _ _
\'I. — - - —_—
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BID #17-14
RADIO EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION
NYSC - #PT67405
WELLS WELLS
COMMUNICATION |UNITED RADIO INC{ COMMUNICATION LAST BID PRICING
SERVICE INC SERVICE INC OR
UNITED RADIO INC
N UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
ACCESSORIES:
KRA-26M VHF HELICAL ANTENNA 146-162 MHz $10.50 N/A $10.20
KRA-22M VHF SHORT HELICAL ANTENNA 148-162 MHz $10.27 N/A $10.00
KRA-27M UHF WHIP ANTENNA 440-490 MHz $10.50 N/A $10.20
KRA-23M UHF SHORT WHIP ANTENNA 450-490 MHz $10.27 N/A $10.00
KNB-33L 2000 mAh, LIION BATTERY $78.75 NIA $76.50
KNB-43L 3300 MmAh, LI-POLYMER BATTERY $122.25 N/A $118.98
KSC-32 ' RAPID RATE SINGLE UNIT CHARGER $52.50 N/A $51.00
KBH-11 SPRING ACTION BELT CLIP (2.5") - TK-180/5210 SERIES $11.02 N/A $10.70
$33.19 N/A $32.20
KLH-122 HEAVY DUTY LEATHER CARRING CASE W/SWIVEL for 180 SERIES (Non DTMF keypad models)
KMC-41M MIL-SPEC, IP 54/55, NOISE CANCELLING SPEAKER MIC $72.37 N/A $70.35
MOTOQOROLA MINITOR VI PAGER
A03JACBIA2_N MINITOR VI SINGLE CHANNEL PAGER VHF 143-174 MHz STANDARD PACKAGE : $351.00 $345.00 $304.20
A03JAC9JA2_N MINITOR VI FIVE CHANNEL PAGER VHF 143-174 MHz STANDARD PACKAGE $392.25 $385.00 $339.95
QPTIONS:
RA0064 1YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY $15.00 $19.00 $20.00
RA00641 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY ' $45.00 $58.00 $60.00
R687 CHARGER WITH AUDIO AMPLIFIER AND RELAY (ORDER ANTENNA SEPARATELY) $60.00 $69.00 $52.00
ACCESSORIES:
PMNN4438 BATTERY, UL $16.50 $18.50 $11.70
PMNN4451 BATTERY, NON-UL $15.00 $17.50 $10.40
RLN6526 BATTERY TRAY (NON-UL ONLY) $14.96 $15.75 $9.75
RLN6505 STANDARD CHARGER | $33.75 $39.00 $25.35
RLN6506 AMPLIFIER CHARGER BASE $89.25 $105.00 $70.85
RLN6507 ANTENNA, VHF AMPLIFIER CHARGER $7.50 $9.00 $6.50
RLN6509 BELTCLIP | _ . $9.37 . $10.50 $6.37
PMLN6725 STANDARD NYLON CARRY CASE $12.75 $15.50 $9.75
RLN6527 PROGRAMMING KIT $66.75 $78.00 $25.35
$1,129.08 $1,184.75
MIDLAND CB RADIO
1001LWX MIDLAND 40 CHANNEL CB RADIO $74.50 N/A $62.50
ACCESSORIES:
\’/ L~ RN
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BID #17-14
RADIO EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION
NYSC - #PT67405
WELLS WELLS
COMMUNICATION |UNITED RADIO INC{ COMMUNICATION | LAST BID PRICING
SERVICE INC SERVICE INC OR
UNITED RADIO INC
UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE
_ ) DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED

ROADPRO RPPS-13KB CB ANTENNAKIT

431.25 N/A $32.50

ALL BIDDERS UNDERSTAND THE FOLLOWING:

ALL PRICES WILL REMAIN FIRM FOR ONE (1) YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD.

ALL PRICES INCLUDE APPLICABLE PROGRAMMING AND DELIVERY TO THE RESPECTIVE COUNTY DEPARTMENTS.

ORDERS FOR SPECIFIC RADIOS AND/OR COMPONENTS WILL BE PLACED ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS, WITH NO GUARANTEE
OF MINIMUM PURCHASES BY THE COUNTY.

COMMENTS:
DEVIATIONS:

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENJFED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS.
THIS DATA mIOCrUYOJ. BE _Z._._w.wﬁmm._.&a hOZ%bﬂZOZ OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.
THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT :Sg AN >§I>m BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.
~ \4 cia \ﬁ oA
6/26/2017 7 4L L e~

/ PU

DATE A FCHASING DEPARTMENT
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